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1. Introduction 

The method of learning is based on the relationship and interaction between academics, students, and educational 

resources. At present, the predominant developments regarding education contemplate the importance of multiple scales, 

including cognition and affective-motivational, with the latter exceeding the former. In this context, teaching support, 
encompassing the development of curriculum, pedagogical approaches, resources availability, and the general 

educational setting, is critical for the academic and educational achievement of students (Brandisauskiene et al., 2021). 

Addressing the unique features and impacts of teaching support is critical in higher education, whereby resources for 
education and methods of instruction could vary from what exists in developed areas of the world. 

 In fact, the teaching support offered by an academic has significant impact on HEI students’ motivation for academic 

activities. Whenever academics stay readily available, skilled, and dedicated, students feel compelled to delve farther 
over the subject matter. Classrooms education is effective, for instance classes incorporating engaging elements and 

personalized states that suit students’ various learning styles, making them feel valued and respected. The assistance 

provided fosters a positive learning atmosphere where students can make inquiries and learn subjects. Academics which 

are sincerely concerned regarding their students' success boost confidence by encouraging students to exercise on the 

responsibility of the quality of their education. Finally, excellent academic support motivates children to set goals for 
academic achievement (Jiang and Zhang, 2021; Zhao and Yang, 2022; Ansong et al., 2024). 

 

2.    Understanding Learning Motivation 

In the realm of HEI, motivation within academic achievement is regarded as an internally vital asset from the perspective 

of independent learning, and many researchers have carried out investigations into students’ reactions to various 

educational challenges. Throughout this entire procedure, students’ perceptions regarding academic relationships serve 

as an important component in the construction of an effective educational setting that supports the academic’s effort to 

Abstract: Several strategies encourage students to pursue higher education. The influences could be internal or 

external. This article examines the academic teaching support on learning motivation in higher education institutions 

in students’ drive to learn. The existing research on motivation for learning indicates how academics might improve 

students’ motivation for academic achievement. Though students might possess a natural drive to study, the academic 

help they receive have an enormous effect on their educational experience. An academic contribution to motivation 

entails, yet is not confined to, establishing an atmosphere conducive to education. The academic function of 

supporting student independence, value, along with connection of the subject boost’s motivation for educational 
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increase student motivation. This is the reason why several studies on motivation in educational technique concentrate 
exclusively on the student-academic interaction. 

 Motivation boosts student participation in any educational activity. Students’ ability to learn is frequently accelerated 

through their own intrinsic drive to succeed in or finish a given task; yet, extrinsic variables, which include incentives 

and rewards, may additionally have an impact on the educational experience of students (Radil et al., 2023). The education 

of students is not contingent just on their individual motivations. Academics have an important role in boosting students’ 

learning by providing motivational assistance. Academics may boost students’ motivation to study by promoting 

independence, significance, connection, expertise, academic dedication to the topic of study, and self-confidence. 

Although motivation may either be intrinsic or extrinsic, it’s becoming essential for academics to foster a setting that 
encourages the academic achievement of students (Siacor et al., 2024).  

 Motivation is understood as possessing various interpretations. In this context, motivation is defined as an inner urge 

that motivates individuals to get involved with a task simply due to the sense of accomplishment they gain doing it. 

Apparently, student motivation is inherently linked with students’ willingness to take part in the educational process. 

However, it further addresses the motives or aims that motivate their participation or non-participation in educational 

endeavors. Another definition of motivation involves goal-driven education, that encourages and directs individuals in a 

specific agenda. Students that are driven to study generally are far more inclined to fulfill the objectives, whether 

established by themselves or through the teacher. Whilst motivation can be defined in a variety of ways, it certainly 
affects the education of students (Martin et al., 2024). 

 Ultimately, students’ motivation for education stems from a variety of internal and external influences. On one side, 

learners generally inherently enthusiastic about learning owing to their individual passion for and fulfillment in the 

subject matter or objectives, thereby adding profound significance concerning what had acquired and its implications for 

their personal development. On the contrary, certain students concentrate better when a real reward or merit is tied to the 
achievement in education. Students that are naturally driven seem to do well on specific tasks and become more eager to 

succeed. Internal and external motivation equally boosts students’ desire for educational pursuits (Vedder-Weiss et al., 
2024). 

 

3.   Learning Motivation in Higher Education Institution 

At its core, motivation is a willingness to acquire knowledge. As a result, it influences whether a student is inclined 

toward giving up or enduring, and it also impacts the extent to which they ponder upon their education. The greater the 

motivation towards following a goal, the greater the probability the student would reject straightforward responses to 

intricate issues. In brief, the intrinsic motivation cultivates robust and adaptable analytical capabilities. In contrast, 

motivation and predominantly extrinsic motivation contributed to lack of enthusiasm and persistent academic 

performance, highlighted below (Deci and Ryan, 2019; Filgona et al., 2020; Weiler & Murad, 2022; Herpratiwi & Tohir, 
2022; Chakraborty, 2023; Wang, 2024). 

a. Motivation nurtures creativeness and analytical thinking: Intrinsically motivated students 

perceive education as a form of enjoyment. As an outcome, students become more inclined to reverse the lesson 
and experience the situation from a different perspective. Motivated students might not be smarter than 

disinterested students; however, the desire to know the solution for some challenge as well as grasp a subject 

stimulates their thinking processes. Intrinsically motivated pupils will consider issues that go further than within 

the educational barriers, since the existence of the academic or the possibility of an undesirable result does not 

constitute the driving forces behind their thought process. As a result, motivated students tend to pose farther 

down, intriguing inquiries by pondering more deeply and deliberately, as well as appreciating the difficulties of 

feeling puzzled. Motivated students are better equipped to apply learnt knowledge in diverse contexts due to the 

attempt to consider deeper reasons or contexts. 

b. Motivation nurtures flexibility and self-self-confidence: Whenever a student is completely 

immersed in an activity, they are left with fewer mental and psychological capacity to devote to social standing. 

Students as participating in intrinsically stimulating endeavors demonstrate that their self-consciousness along 

with other concerns diminishes throughout the duration of their participation. Motivated students additionally 

are more inclined to “rebound again” about a poor academic performance or severe assessment by an academic 

or colleague. As students with intrinsic motivation aren't inspired by the prospect of disappointment or 

disagreements, they are considerably inclined to withdraw from such scenarios. Having stated this, each student 

feels the demoralizing impacts associated with adverse comments, although less motivated pupils perceive it to 

a fewer value. 

c. Motivation and HEI: HEI can be summarized simply as an overwhelming feeling of direction and 

independence in achieving the objectives one has set. HEI and motivation have an inherent connection notion 

since, when a student develops more motivated to achieve an objective, it gives them an additional feeling of 

meaning in channeling their attention in the direction of achieving that objective. Whenever it involves 

educational accomplishment, students who are exceptionally driven discover ways to carve an independent route 



Lin1 & Zaheril2., Uniglobal of Journal Social Sciences and Humanities Vol. 3 Issue. 2 (2024) p. 263-273 

 

265 

and are dubious of another’ restrictions. Determined professionals additionally tend to be likely to be critical of 

conventional thinking or domain standards, preferring to continually push themselves by exploring 

revolutionary concepts. 

 

Ultimately, learning motivation is critical to academic achievement as well as individual development. It motivates 
students to establish objectives, overcome obstacles, and remain involved in their educational journey. Absent motivation, 

students might be unable to find meaning as well as purpose throughout their educational endeavors, leading to disinterest 

and low academic achievement. Motivation, both intrinsic and extrinsic, assists students in developing an impression of 

responsibility throughout their educational experiences, which promotes self-control and a mindset of improvement. 

On that basis, this article believes that academics play a critical role in promoting such inspiration through the 

creation of supportive and interesting educational atmospheres that acknowledge the students’ distinctive requirements 

and abilities. Academics might encourage students to discover emerging fields of education, conquer challenges, and 

aspire for perfection by instilling an enthusiasm for education in them. In an age when continuing education is becoming 

ever more important, building a solid foundation of learning motivation provides students with the resources that they 

require to progress and succeed either academically or as individuals. 

 

4.   Academic Teaching Support in Higher Education Institution 

Academics play a crucial part in developing an atmosphere that encourages students to pursue education. Academics 
frequently accomplish this by encouraging students’ self-determination. In this context, academics assist students to 

engage themselves, particular preferences, and principles by allowing students to make decisions for themselves. 

Eventually, academics allow students to create individual curiosity, participation, and responsibility for what they do by 

encouraging their choices and interests. 

Academics additionally support students in studying by enhancing their accountability and involvement in the 

process of learning by allowing students to choose their own objectives and targets. Studies with respect to the 

environment of the connection between students’ perceptions of social assistance and support for autonomy coming from 

academics, as well as autonomous learning and academic success, found a substantial connection between students’ 

perceptions concerning their academics’ autonomous assistance and independent learning. Academics that assist their 

students in becoming the creators of their individual life, taking accountability and developing an authentic curiosity in 

what they do, boost students' desire and determination for academic achievement (Brandisauskiene et al., 2021; Zhao and 
Yang, 2022; Ansong et al., 2024). 

Engaging with students’ real worlds is yet another method by which academics promote their students’ educational 

experience. Academics correspond to discovering lessons to students’ own lives through rendering educational tasks 

more meaningful by linking guidelines to student perspectives. Students who grasp the importance of studying a specific 

idea together with what that understanding means for their daily routines tend to be more interested (Merbert et al., 2020; 

O’Neill and Short, 2023; Sulaiman and Abdullah, 2024).  

A research investigation investigated how four methods of instruction—process-oriented education, distinction, 

linking to students’ worlds (significance), and collaborative learning—impacted the motivation of students. The research 

results demonstrated that engaging with students’ real worlds (significance) has a favorable impact on their motivation 

to learn. Students must understand the connections between whatever they’re learning during lessons and the significance 

it has in their personal lives. For instance, students might compose essays about how the curriculum affected their 
everyday lives. Students have a greater tendency to be motivated to acquire knowledge once they feel that what they 

discover has significance and relevance to their own lives (Saeed et al., 2021; Mladenovici et al., 2022;). 

Academics who foster outstanding connections with the students they teach seem more inclined to impact their 

motivation for academic achievement. Establishing credibility in relationships demands commitment. Academics ought 

to acquire acquaintance with their students and their passions. To build confidence, academics ought to remain receptive 

as well as occasionally discuss their personal experiences, problems, mistakes, and accomplishments. Satisfying people's 

fundamental desire for connections encourages intrinsic behavior, which can contribute to students’ enthusiasm for 

educational pursuits. Establishing trustworthy connections with kids can be tough but being pleasant and supportive can 

boost intrinsic motivation among students (Ribosa et al., 2024). 

According to research on the association between students’ perceptions of social support and independence guidance 

from their academics and autonomous achievement and development, the connection between students and their 

academics possesses a positive effect on their educational experience, achievement at educational institutions, and 
psychological and social well-being. Strong commitment to working intimately with students may influence the character 

of the relationship between educators and students. Academics’ favorable, loving, and trustworthy connections with their 

students might motivate them to pursue their education (Leenknecht et al., 2020; Ali et al., 2023; Mitev et al., 2024). 

Academics encourage students to pursue education through offering encouragement and helping them gain 

competency. Giving feedback allows pupils to have authority over their personal development and fosters a feeling of 

confidence in their talents. Academics who offer students suggestions for improving their attempts to instill in them the 

belief that dedication will enable them to accomplish responsibilities and perform effectively. There are numerous 

approaches for improving students’ competencies. The most prevalent approaches involve giving either written or spoken 
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compliments, spotting errors less frequently, acknowledging students’ skills, and emphasizing what is good regarding 

what they have produced. Research findings on the effect of academic support in determining students' motivation and 

achievement results in physical education classes indicated that perceived academic skill support, which included 

favorable appraisal, significantly improved students’ expectancy-related assumptions concerning their ability to carry out 

responsibilities effectively. Students are going to feel inspired to continue learning once academics acknowledge their 
dedication in completing activities (Al-Hattami, 2019; McConlogue, 2020; Sun, 2021; Schwab et al., 2022; Zaky, 2023; 

Williams, 2024). 

The degree that HEI academics take pleasure in their methods of instruction influences the desire of students to 

acquire knowledge. Academics who feel passionate concerning their field of study or profession tend to attribute positive 

emotions and value towards their teaching methods. Students monitor their teachers’ behavior and actions in classroom. 

An academic who expresses curiosity and enthusiastic ideas towards an area of study could impress similar beneficial 

emotions on students, improving their motivation for exploring about the topic. Academics’ perspectives, passions, and 

excitement for their field of study may influence students’ motivation to pursue education (Li et al., 2022; Falcon et al., 

2023; Alghamdi and Khadawardi, 2024).  

Fuertes’s et al. (2023) research investigated the impact of academic excitement on engagement among students as 

well as readiness to acquire knowledge by surveying 400 HEI students. The survey questioned students to score their 

educator’s excitement, self-evaluate the cognitive, behavioral, and psychological engagement, as well as evaluate the 
intrinsic and extrinsic incentive for learning. The findings revealed that academics passion had a substantial effect on 

student involvement; additionally, academics excitement was an excellent indicator of the intrinsic motivation of 

students. Students’ motivation for academic achievement is frequently increased by the academics’ passion in their 

subject matter, as well as the extent to which dynamism and enthusiasm that demonstrate when lecturing. 

Academics’ confidence in their capability to motivate uninspired students may stimulate students' excitement about 

learning. Academics trust in their ability to apply excellent instructional tactics, administer classrooms, and to involve 

students in interaction might assist students attain knowledge. Basileo et al. (2011) found that academics perceived self-

efficacy, as well as four instructional techniques, had a positive impact on student motivation and their own instructional 

methods. Although academics' capacity to enhance their abilities as educators and methodologies is vital for self-efficacy, 

the emphasis ought to concentrate on improving student retention by sparking discussion, providing precise guidance, 

and providing full clarifications. 
Certain academics stimulate students in conversing, allowing students to pose inquiries, ponder, and remain actively 

involved in the material. In a different investigation, Alghamdi and Khadawardi (2024) looked at the effectiveness of an 

academic’s motivational tactics to see if their methods had any influence on students’ acquisition of English as a foreign 

language. The students’ motivation and proficiency in English were assessed at the onset of collecting the data. The 

findings revealed that seven of the seventeen motivating tactics had a favorable impact on the motivation of students. 

Academics’ confidence in their field of study, instructional abilities, and excellent administration of the classroom 

increase the desire of students to acquire knowledge. 

Academic teaching support plays an integral part in improving the quality of education. It gives academics the 

necessary resources, instruments, and guidance they need to enhance their approaches to learning and the achievements 

of students. Coaching, continuing education sessions, technological resources, and educational design aid are all possible 

forms of support. By providing targeted assistance, schools guarantee that educators are prepared to address varied 

educational demands and remain current on innovative instructional techniques. Furthermore, academic teaching support 
promotes an environment of collaboration in which academics may exchange efficient methods and solve problems 

simultaneously. Finally, these resources improve educational experiences, promoting student achievement as well as 

academic performance. In the present-day rapidly evolving educational scene, good academic teaching support is critical 

to sustaining an excellent educational experience and encouraging ongoing progress. 

 

5.   Role of Teaching Support in Higher Learning Institution 

Critical thinking, as well as abilities to think creatively, is fundamental to the idea of imparting knowledge to be 

competitive in the worldwide economy of the twenty-first century. Furthermore, not only do we need to acquire novel 

forms of social engagement in the twenty-first century, yet additionally, we must discard habits which were previously 

helpful although might become antiquated in the not-too-distant future. 

        Academics have “not learn” the Sage-on-the-Stage (stands or sit at the front of the classroom and imparts knowledge 

– remember and memorizing) posture to become the prevailing methods of instruction, thus the transition to Guide-on-
the-Side (student-centered learning – think and not memorizing) pedagogical has proven essential in shifting the 

centerpiece of teaching methods from academia to the student. Facilitating the process of creativity has consistently been 

particularly important in the field of arts education. Think about studying techniques to create artwork by studying 

masters of painting like Rembrandt and Michelangelo using PowerPoint presentations in an interactive Zoom or Skype 

meeting. There is certainly an explanation why student HEIs seek such exceptional artists. Both excelled in coaching and 

encouraging students of art to achieve mastery. 

        According to Gilbert, Tait-McCutcheon, and Knewstubb (2020), a study of innovative teaching in higher education 

based on teachers’ perceptions of support and constraint indicates that rapidly changing trends in comprehension are 
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worth regarding the significance of technological tools in education, along with needs of students underscore the vitality 

of inventiveness. On the contrary, several different variables can influence the pace and method of invention. Gilbert et 

al. (ibid) identified five theme elements of notable inventive academics that influenced or prevented pedagogic 

imaginative thinking: (i) the academics, (ii) the HEI, (iii) classmates, (iv) students, and (v) the educational setting. 

        In the same vein, today’s HEI debate about educational transition in the twenty-first century is mostly concerned 
with the spectrum of competencies or capacities that are regarded to be vital throughout millennia’s educational 

institutions graduates. Innovative thinking constitutes one of them, and teaching professionals, legislators, and business 

professionals all agree it is crucial for achievement in both personal and professional lives in the twenty-first century. 

Furthermore, although analytical thinking has recently been identified as a key component of curricular changes, 

alongside the quest for student-driven pedagogies, yet continues to be a little widespread consensus concerning this 

notion. Academic staff, for example, confront the difficult responsibility of creating and sustaining a curriculum and 

educational system that reflects a post-millennial social context within which supply and demand remain neither 

exponential nor continuous. Labor is characterized by intricate structures of anticipation, possibilities, duration, and 

location, and distinctive blends of “innovative” talents and expertise often highly valued (Varas et al., 2023; Abramowitz 

et al., 2024; Alainati, 2024; Low, 2024). 

        According to study by Meyer and Mncayi (2021), supplementary requirements throughout higher education, 

corresponding to specific ideas, are associated with greater employment prospects as well as increased prospective wages 
through enhanced professional development choices. Nevertheless, in nations experiencing substantial rates of 

unemployment, whereby skilled students struggle to get a place of employment, these viewpoints are frequently 

questioned. Higher education is not believed to have become a guaranteed source of jobs. In 2019, for example, South 

Africa had the highest proportion of mismatch employment among thirty different nations (which incorporates India and 

Russia), involving expertise incompatibilities of over fifty percent as well as a declining productivity rate (Jackson et al., 

2023; Habet et al., 2020; Jones et al., 2024; Pham et al., 2024). 

        Meanwhile Pham (2024) claims stated based on societal specialists on workforce as well as community-based 

futures contracts, majority contemporary younger generation will find employment in virtually augmented surroundings 

featuring compact mobile schematics for developing projects along with administration. HEI graduates will be engaged 

in employment that is substantially fewer dependent on typical information collecting, transactions implementation, 

including figuring out solutions, and substantially more centered around forging collaborations, addressing unique 
difficulties, in addition integrating “think big” circumstances as prospective future endeavors “imaginative individuals.”  

        According to Subasman and Rusmiati Aliyyah (2023), on the contrary, the difficulty of the HEI graduates in today’s 

“theoretical years” remains a combination of functioning in technologically advanced settings. However, there is an 

additional demand by employing “excessive concept/high connection” capacities to construct and reconstruct the 

privilege of individual and professional circumstances within methods that comply with our both practical as well as 

aesthetically pleasing requirements. In the opinion of Hoque et al. (2023), outstanding conceptualization abilities 

encompass the capacity to produce creative and psychological aesthetics, identify correlations and potential, design a 

pleasing narrative, and merge completely unconnected notions into innovative creations. Whenever paired alongside 

relational “high touch” skills such as empathy, appreciate the nuances of interactions between individuals, and connect 

with people in profoundly beneficial manners, these attributes will eventually develop into an impressive and increasingly 

essential combo. 

        Kerrigan et al. (2022) contend this de-routinizing existing and prospective innovative endeavors have significant 
consequences regarding what and the way academia function. Yet, contemporary pedagogical practice, particularly in 

HEIs, is strongly connected to a twentieth-century workplace culture centered on gathering intelligence and implementing 

it to remedy generally foreseeable challenges or perform repetitive activities of a certain type. Lennox (2024) indicates 

that academics must enable students to “access” the understanding of the “appropriate;” courses direct students 

throughout their strive towards “master” the abilities of particular “master;” along with evaluation tasks demonstrate the 

upcoming apprentice's success as far as of “understanding’ the subject matter. This transmissive educational paradigm is 

quickly growing obsolete in a globe where scientific understanding as a collection of “the fact assertions” possesses a 

limited lifespan. It is additionally losing relevance in a society whereby students can do both simultaneously. 

        In a nutshell, work-integrated learning has evolved into an integral component of higher education programs in the 

creative industries section. An educational environment allows students to acquire knowledge a limited amount. The 

manufacturing sector will perpetually possess the most sophisticated technology and tools. Given the scarce resources 
accessible for purchasing the most recent technologies utilized by companies, the most practical option is to arrange for 

students to intern in the sector as a component of the method of experiential education although remaining enrolled as 

students. Students have been exposed to the latest developments, allowing them to anticipate which the next decade 

promises and what abilities might be required to succeed (Dean and Matthew, 2020; Moalosi et al., 2021; Jackson et al., 

2022; Jackson and Dean, 2022; ACEN, 2023; Jackson et al. 2024). According to Mabungela and Mtiki (2024), it is 

commonly accepted as accomplishing an employment placement as a component of a sandwich-based university program 

promotes either student or companies, particularly during an era whereby higher education is highlighted for its financial 

benefit in enhancing the employment prospects of graduates. This benefit is two-fold: first, employment opportunities 
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tend to develop universal abilities for employment, and second, internships provide graduates a leg up in their professional 

life. 

 

        To put it simply, teaching in higher education institutions in the twenty-first century has a transforming impact on 

the development of upcoming administrators, entrepreneurs and experts. With significant technological improvements, 
teaching has moved over conventional approaches to include digital resources, hybrid education, and immersive 

environments. The cutting-edge academic is not merely an information presenter; they are also facilitators of innovative 

thinking, imaginative thinking, and innovative problem-solving. Higher education institutions are responsible for 

educating students to succeed in a global and linked world, which necessitates a concentration on multidisciplinary 

methods and practical applications. Moreover, diversity and inclusion have taken center stage, enabling equal opportunity 

in HEI for every student. In today’s world, teaching stresses continuous education, enabling students to quickly adjust to 

the constantly shifting expectations of the job marketplace. In the end, teaching in the present-day HEIs is an ever-

changing, complex job that impacts not merely educational achievement, however additionally individual and 

professional growth in a continuously changing environment. 

 

6.    Learning Motivation Challenges of The Digital Age 

The digital age has altered HEI, providing new ways to study through technology. However, it brings unique obstacles. 

One big concern is the digital gap, which means that accessibility to dependable technology and the web continues to be 
inequitable, restricting chances for some students. Furthermore, the vast abundance of internet information could render 

it challenging to identify trustworthy sources, potentially resulting in disinformation. Students might additionally have 

trouble sustaining motivation and concentration in virtual contexts owing to diversions and an absence of in-person 

connection. Afterwards, while digital literacy is critical, not all students are prepared with the appropriate abilities for 

utilizing and navigating technological advances efficiently. Overcoming such challenges is critical to providing inclusive 

high-quality HEI opportunities in the age of digital technology. 

        Today, most HEI in industrialized nations, along with numerous other developing nations, increasingly depends on 

technological advances as a moderating instrument for educational instruction and assessment. As an outcome, students 

opt to “digest” online educational content at their own discretion to reduce hours getting around and escape the rush hour 

on a morning. Practically, every student reverences and increasingly anticipates non-synchronous, in-demand online 

courses across every subject (Kuleshova et al., 2020; Salama and Hinton, 2023). However, the situation continues to 
deteriorate once the COVID-19 epidemic erupted; notwithstanding the readiness of industries having financial resources 

to encourage blended educational opportunities, issues related to availability along with diversified educational and 

workplace settings have emerged. This became particularly evident in the HEI, as students competed sought outstanding 

results on courses which depended largely on a hands-on element, especially utilized technologies. Directly involved 

hands-on activities constitute crucial components of HEI and will not be simply substituted with virtual online classes 

(Raju, 2020; Azizan et al., 2022; Wei et al., 2023; Krishnan and Sharma, 2024). 

        Teaching academics observed an eagerness to comprehend more about students’ various life experiences and 

different cultures as they strove to interact with their educational environment across the bounds of technological gadgets 

as well as the technological divide. It should be noted that people who are intrigued by the scholarship of Brazilian 

educator and thinker Paulo Freire, which strove to perceive the social environment through the eyes of students, is already 

acquainted with the notion of making human pedagogy. Though, Freire’s educational concepts emerged in a pre-digital 
era, when a contextual pedagogical constituted the cornerstone of his work. Freire documented his experiences of 

educational and instructional activities in open environments and in personnel. Digital classrooms, on the contrary 

present, involve distant interaction, typically utilizing smart phones and computers. The ocean of literature questions how 

Freire's work's ideas may be adapted to a virtual educational context. Perhaps Boyd’s underlying system for “learning 

teaching” would be an appropriate starting point to start investigating it. In this context, Boyd focuses on the fundamental 

concepts of Freire’s work, which might serve as a regenerative prism for academics seeking an empathetic approach 

towards online educational assistance (Freire, 1970; Boyd, 2016; Farag et al., 2021; Pietersen, 2022; Costa et al., 2023; 

Mandal. 2023; Zuin and Mello, 2024). 

        Last but not least, problem-based learning, discourse, experiential learning, and equitable possession of education 

are examples of ideals that encourage educational transformation. In addition, there has yet much to be discovered 

concerning the principles of humanizing educational methods in today’s technological world. Only the passage of time 

will determine if the worldwide HEI sector is prepared to embrace the concept of hybrid education, which combines 
sophisticated technological online education technologies alongside conventional traditional classroom instruction, or if 

such efforts will simply be overlooked as intermittent and ephemeral following the global epidemic passes. 

 

7.   Developing Academic Support for The 21st Century 

Developing academic support for the 21st century in HEIs is essential for adapting to the evolving needs of students in a 

technology-driven world. This condition requires a multifaceted approach that leverages technology into curriculum, 

inclusivity, and personalized learning. As education shifts toward digital platforms and more flexible learning 
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environments, institutions must rethink traditional methods of student support. In the past decades, it seems to be a 

growing interest in determining whether employment might continue to exist in the not-too-distant future (Abramowitz 

et al., 2024) 

        Furthermore, educational institutions must encourage a diverse educational setting through accommodating the 

different educational demands and experiences of both academics and students (Mitev et al., 2024). Providing training 
on interpersonal competencies such as managing time along with analytical thinking, together with resources for 

psychological wellness, improves the wellness of students and educational achievement (O’Neill, G. and Short, 2023). 

Individualized educational guidance, support from peers, including HEIs academic engagement additionally prove 

significant for dealing with students’ unique educational pathways. This guarantees that students have access to assists 

at any point in time, whatever their geographical distance (ACEN, 2023; Costa et al., 2023). 

        Relevant competences have significance as attributes which an organization’s recruitment find appealing to potential 

employees with digital skills particularly AI tools (Pham, 2024; yen, 2024). Throughout the hiring procedure, standards 

are frequently employed as norms to rate and evaluate candidates, particularly while examining resumes and undertaking 

interviews (Habets et al., 2020; Hoque et al., 2023). By integrating machine learning technology, inclusiveness, and 

personalized support, higher education institutions can equip students with the skills and resources they need to thrive in 

the rapidly evolving 21st-century academic and professional landscape (Raju, 2020; Almazroa and Alotaibi, 2023) 

        For HEIs to provide students with the necessary 21st-century job readiness abilities that organizations require, 
present educational and curriculum systems must be examined and enhanced. To bridge the gap across HEI curriculum 

and marketplace expectations, innovative methods of instruction need to be implemented which includes a change to 

shift from simply providing theoretical instruction to arming students with both theoretical and practical skills. In order 

to be deemed marketable, graduates must demonstrate brand-new, transforming, and expanding competencies in domains 

such as information security, data mining, and machine learning. 

        Barrot (2023) extends to discuss the topic of evaluating curriculum for the twenty-first century, arguing since the 

absence of a home-tailored syllabus in certain HEI aggravated the dearth of feasible, technological in nature, and various 

other qualities relevant to the requirements of industry. A great deal of HEI presents that certain institutions in wealthy 

nations lacking an internal content adapted to their respective industries’ demands and instead impart content adopted 

from other countries (Bakay, 2022; Barrot, 2023; Judijanto et al., 2024; Yidana and Aboagye, 2024). Consequently, 

students lack the competencies required by companies. 
        Similarly, Vela et al. (2024) argue that at nearly all HEIs, a large proportion of academics have received extensive 

training in curriculum while demonstrating an extensive knowledge of the areas they present. However, competence in 

skill development is an entirely different matter. The issue herein does not revolve around whether academics help 

students learn abilities - indeed, they do - however whether such cognitive abilities fulfill the objectives of knowledge-

driven personnel, and if the educational program lays a sufficient emphasis on the development of skills (Dilekci and 

Karatay, 2023).  

        Prior, in the words of McAteer et al. (2023), academics must guarantee students have the right skills to deal with 

such problems. Considering it influences all fields of expertise, all academics have borne some duty in the field of 

education. Whenever we inquire about gaining skills for the twenty-first century as well as strategizing towards a 

computer-generated culture, we as humans mean this. Virtual educational experiences are important given that what 

students are learning ought to be virtually integrated to further develop such abilities (Ahmad et al., 2019). Everyone can 

control technological devices once we as a species have mastered it. 
        In the end, establishing academic support for the twenty-first century in HEI s is critical for educational achievement 

in an extremely complicated and ever-changing global environment. The multifaceted nature of present-day issues 

surrounding sustainability necessitates a reconsideration of prevailing teaching methodologies and methods of curriculum 

which define HEIs to prepare students and staff for confronting alongside growing modifications, ever-more complicated 

and challenged assertions of expertise, and even inevitable uncertainty. Besides, a concentration on diversity guarantees 

that students from different cultural backgrounds receive academic as well as psychological support. To solve specific 

issues, institutions must provide customized assistance including individualized coaching and mentoring by peers. Well-

being resources, combined with acquiring skills programs, improve the general wellness of students and employment 

preparedness. Following that, a purposeful mixture of technological advances, inclusion, and customized academic 

support provides students with the support and assurance they require to be successful in the twenty-first century, 

preparing individuals for achievement throughout an ever-changing educational and employment context. 
 

8.    Conclusion 

Lastly, student achievement is impacted by motivation to succeed. Despite students having been born possessing an 

inherent capacity to study, their success is heavily contingent on dedication to education. Occasionally students’ vitality, 

ambition, and passion for an area of knowledge or endeavor decrease, necessitating continuous encouragement via 

supplementary activities. Academics, individuals in charge of providing an atmosphere of encouragement which supports 

and improves the education of students, frequently give essential independent assistance. Thus, academics’ role in 

assisting students’ motivation is regarded as supporting the development of students’ independence, significance, 

connection to and competency in academics’ passions, and academics’ self-confidence when instructing their subject 
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matter. While students’ motivation to study might be intrinsic or extrinsic, the academic’s involvement in supporting 

their education and developing a conducive environment will boost their excitement for educational pursuits. Lastly, 

academic support stimulates the motivation of students, provides these individuals with the abilities they require to 

achieve successful academic achievement, as well as prepares for life as professionals. HEIs may build an increasingly 

motivated, flexible, and lucrative student population by constantly adapting teaching support systems to match the 
demands of the twenty-first century. 

Acknowledgement  

The authors would like to express their gratitude to the City University for their support in providing both facilities and 

financial assistance for this research. 

Conflict of Interest 

The authors declare no conflicts of interest. 

 

References 

 

Abramowitz, K., Fischman, W. & Gardner, H. (2024). Higher education in the twenty-first century; What’s the mission? 

Daedalus, 153(2), 301-315. DOI:10.1162/daed_a_02082 

ACEN. (2023). Student participation in Work Integrated Learning in higher education: A three-year review. Sydney: 

Australian Collaborative Education Network.   

Ahmad, S. A., Yoke, S., Yunos, R. & Mohd Amin, J. (2019). Exploring lecturers’ readiness for 21st century education 
in Malaysian higher learning institutions. European Journal of Teaching and Education, 1, 15-29. 

DOI:10.33422/EJTE.2019.10.27. 

Al-Hattami, A. A. (2019). The perception of students and faculty staff on the role of constructive feedback. International 

Journal of Instruction, 12(1), 885-894. Retrieved from fpsyg-12-746871 

Alainati, S. (2024). The role of educational systems in developing twenty-first century skills: Perspectives and initiatives 

of gulf cooperation council countries. Journal of Business and Management, 26(1), 44-57. DOI:10.9790/487X-

2601034457. 

Alghamdi, M. & Khadawardi, H. (2024). Investigating the impact of teacher enthusiasm on engagement among Saudi 

First-Year EFL students. International Journal of English Language Education, 12(2), 86-121. 

DOI:10.5296/ijele.v12i2.22241. 

Ali, M. R., Uppal, M. A., Jose Renato, P. J., Qasim, H., Shafi, A. & Hussain, W. A. (2023). Educators’ relationships and 

its impacts on students’ educational outcomes in higher educational institutions of Pakistan. Cogent Education, 
10(2), 1-22. DOI:10.1080/2331186X.2023.2282802 

Almazroa, H. & Alotaibi, W. (2023). Teaching 21st century skills: Understanding the depth and width of the challenges 

to shape proactive teacher education programmes. Sustainability, 15(9), 1-25. DOI:10.3390/su15097365. 

Ansong, D., Okumu, M., Amoako, E. O., Appiah-Kubi, J., Ampomah, A. O., Koomson, I. & Hamilton, E. (2024). The 

role of teacher supports students’ academic performance in low- and high-stakes assessments, learning and 

individual differences. Learning and Individual Differences, 109(2), 1-15. DOI:10.1016/j.lindif.2023.102396 

Azizan, S. N., Lee, A., Crosling, G., Atherton, G., Arulanandam, B., Catherine Lee, C. E. & Abdul Rahim, R. (2022). 

Online learning and COVID-19 in higher education: The value of IT models in assessing students’ satisfaction. 

International Journal of Emerging Technologies in Learning, 17(3), 245-278. DOI:10.3991/ijet.v17i03.24871. 

Bakay, M. E. (2022). 21st century skills for higher education students in EU Countries: Perception of academicians and 

HR managers. International Education Studies, 15(2), 14-24. DOI:10.5539/ies.v15n2p14 
Basileo, L. D., Otto, B., Lyons, M., Vannini, N. & Toth MD (2024) The role of self-efficacy, motivation, and perceived 

support of students’ basic psychological needs in academic achievement. Frontiers in Education, 10, 1-17. 

DOI:10.3389/feduc.2024.1385442 

Boyd, D. (2016). What would Paulo Freire think of blackboard: Critical pedagogy in an age of online learning. 

International Journal of Critical Pedagogy, 7(1), 165-186. Retrieved from 

https://core.ac.uk/download/pdf/234819606.pdf 

Brandisauskiene, A., Buksnyte-Marmiene, L., Cesnaviciene, J., Daugirdiene, A., Kemeryte-Ivanauskiene, E. & 

Nedzinskaite, R. (2021). Connection between teacher support and student’s achievement: Could growth mindset 

be the moderator? Sustainability, 13(4), 1-14. DOI:10.3390/su132413632. 

Chakraborty, U. (2023). Motivational theory: An analysis of key concepts and applications. Chhattisgarh: OrangeBooks 

Publication. 

Costa, C., Bhatia, P., Murphy, M. & Pereira, A. L. (2023). Digital education colonized by design: Curriculum reimagined. 
Education Sciences, 13(9), 1-13. DOI:10.3390/educsci13090895 



Lin1 & Zaheril2., Uniglobal of Journal Social Sciences and Humanities Vol. 3 Issue. 2 (2024) p. 263-273 

 

271 

Dean, B. A. & Matthew, C. (2020). Reshaping work-integrated learning in a post-COVID-19 world of work. International 

Journal of Work-Integrated Learning, Special Issue, 21(4), 356-364. Retrieved from 

https://files.eric.ed.gov/fulltext/EJ1271541.pdf 

Deci, E. L., & Ryan, R. M. (2019).  Self-determination theory: Basic psychological needs in motivation, development, 

and wellness. New York: Guilford Press. 
Dilekci, A. & Karatay, H. (2023). The effects of the 21st century skills curriculum on the development of students’ 

creative thinking skills. Thinking Skills and Creativity, 47(6), 1-20. DOI: DOI:10.1016/j.tsc.2022.101229 

Eze, S. C., Chinedu-Eze, V. C. A., Okike, C. K. & Bello, A. O. (2020). Factors influencing the use of e-learning facilities 

by students in a private higher education institution (HEI) in a developing economy. Humanities and Social 

Sciences Communications, 7(133), 1-15. DOI:10.1057/s41599-020-00624-6 

Falcon, F., Admiraal, W. & Leon, J. (2023).  Teachers’ engaging messages and the relationship with students’ 

performance and teachers’ enthusiasm. Learning and Instruction, 86, 1-11. 

DOI:10.1016/j.learninstruc.2023.101750 

Farag, A., Greeley, L. & Swindell, A. (2021). Freire 2.0: Pedagogy of the digitally oppressed. Educational Philosophy 

and Theory, 54, 1-14. DOI:10.1080/00131857.2021.2010541. 

Filgona, J., Sakiyo, J. & Gwany, D & Okoronka, A. (2020). Motivation in learning. Asian Journal of Education and 

Social Studies, 10(4), 16-37. DOI:10.9734/AJESS/2020/v10i430273. 
Freire, P. (1970). Pedagogy of the oppressed. New York: The Continuum International Publishing Group Inc. 

Fuertes, H., Evangelista, I., Marcellones, I. & Bacatan, J. (2023). Student engagement, academic motivation, and 

academic performance of intermediate-level students. International Journal of Novel Research in Education and 

Learning, 10(1), 133-149. DOI:10.5281/zenodo.8037103. 

Habets, O., Stoffers, J., van der Heijden, B. & Peters, P. (2020). Am I fit for tomorrow’s labor market? The effect of 

graduates’ skills development during higher education for the 21st century’s labor market. Sustainability, 12(8), 

1-13. DOI:10.3390/su12187746. 

Herpratiwi, A & Tohir, A. (2022). Learning interest and discipline on learning motivation. International Journal of 

Education in Mathematics, Science and Technology, 10(2), 424-435. DOI:10.46328/ijemst.2290 

Hoque, N., Uddin, M., Ahmad, A., Mamun, A., Uddin, M., Chowdhury, R. & Alam, A. (2023). The desired employability 

skills and work readiness of graduates: Evidence from the perspective of established and well-known employers 
of an emerging economy. Industry and Higher Education, 37(2), 1-23. DOI:10.1177/09504222221149850. 

Jackson, D. & Dean, B. (2022). The contribution of different types of work-integrated learning to graduate employability. 

Higher Education Research & Development, 42, 1-18. DOI:10.1080/07294360.2022.2048638. 

Jackson, D., Dollinger, M., Gatto, L., Drewery, D., Ajjawi, R. & Fannon, A. M. (2024). Work-integrated learning for 

students with disabilities: Time for meaningful change. Higher Education Research & Development, 43, 1-9. 

DOI:10.1080/07294360.2024.2354242 

Jackson, D., Lambert, C., Sibson, R., Bridgstock, R. & Tofa, M. (2023). Student employability-building activities: 

participation and contribution to graduate outcomes. Journal of Further and Higher Education, 48(2), 1-17. 

DOI:10.1080/0309877X.2023.2253426 

Jackson, D., Shan, H. & Meek, S. (2022). Enhancing graduates’ enterprise capabilities through work-integrated learning 

in co-working spaces. Higher Education, 84, 101-120. DOI:10.1007/s10734-021-00756-x 

Jiang, A. L. & Zhang, L. J. (2021). University teachers’ teaching style and their students’ agentic engagement in EFL 
learning in China: A self-determination theory and achievement goal theory integrated perspective. Frontiers in 

Psychology, 12, 1-11. DOI:10.3389/fpsyg.2021.704269 

Jones, S., Santos, R. & Xirinda, G. (2024). Employment mismatches drive expectational earnings errors among 

Mozambican graduates. The World Bank Economic Review, 38(1), 51-73. DOI:10.1093/wber/lhad018 

Judijanto, L., Triolita, N., Macfiroh, R., Yunanto, M. K. & Siminto, A. (2024). Navigating the landscape of higher 

education in the 21st century: Challenges, innovations, and future perspectives. International Journal of Teaching 

and Learning, 2(1), 297-312. Retrieved from https://injotel.org/index.php/12/article/view/66/94 

Kerrigan, S., Grushka, K., Chand, A., Street, K., Shadbolt, J. & Lawry, M. (2022). Creative industries careers: shifting 

aspirations and pathways from high school to university-a NSW case study. Australian Educational Researcher, 

50(5), 1-20. DOI:10.1007/s13384-022-00574-950 

Krishnan, N. & Sharma, R. (2024). Student perception of online teaching in HEI during COVID-19 pandemic: A survey 
study. Journal of Ayurveda and Integrated Medical Sciences, 6(6), 48-61. DOI:10.21760/jaims.6.6.8. 

Kuleshova, V. V., Kutsak, L. V., Liulchak, S. Y., Tsoi, T. V. & Ivanenko, I. V. (2020). Implementation of modern 

distance learning platforms in the educational process of HEI and their effectiveness. International Journal of 

Higher Education, 9(7), 217-229. DOI:10.5430/ijhe.v9n7p217   

Leenknecht, M., Snijders, I., Wijnia, L., Rikers, R. & Loyens, S. (2020). Building relationships in higher education to 

support students’ motivation. Teaching in Higher Education, 28(3), 1-15. DOI:10.1080/13562517.2020.1839748. 

Lennox, E. (2024). Career journey influences mature creative arts students in higher education: A systems theory 

framework approach. The Journal of Continuing Higher Education, 3, 1-16. 

DOI:10.1080/07377363.2024.2309410 



Lin1 & Zaheril2., Uniglobal of Journal Social Sciences and Humanities Vol. 3 Issue. 2 (2024) p. 263-273 

 

272 

Li, Q., Qiang, Q., Liang, J., Pan, X. Zhao, W. (2022). The influence of teaching motivations on student engagement in 

an online learning environment in China. Australasian Journal of Educational Technology, 38(6), 1-20. 

DOI:10.14742/ajet.7280. 

Low, E. L. (2024). Editorial: teacher education in Singapore in the twenty-first century: the past, the present and 

envisioning the future. Educational Research for Policy and Practice, 5, 1-7. DOI:10.1007/s10671-024-09370-x 
Mabungela, M. & Mtiki, S. V. (2024). Accelerating graduate employability through work-integrated learning. Research 

in Social Sciences and Technology, 9(1). 291-304. DOI:10.46303/ressat.2024.17 

Mandal, M. M. (2023). Paulo Freire's pedagogy of liberation: A critical analysis and contemporary perspectives. 

International Journal of Research Publication and Reviews, 4(7), 2328-2337. Retrieved from 

https://ijrpr.com/uploads/V4ISSUE7/IJRPR15548.pdf 

Martin, A. J., Collie, R. J., Stephan, M., Flesken, A., Halcrow, F. & McCourt, B. (2024). What is the role of teaching 

support in students’ motivation and engagement trajectories during adolescence? A four-year latent growth 

modeling study. Learning and Instruction, 92, 1-11. DOI: 10.1016/j.learninstruc.2024.101910 

McConlogue, T. (2020). Assessment and feedback in higher education: A guide for teachers. London: UCL Press. 

McAteer, L., Roche, J. & Kelly, A. M. (2023) Renewing an undergraduate science curriculum for the 21st century. 

Frontiers in Education. 8. 1-12. DOI:10.3389/feduc.2023.1270941 

Mebert, L., Barnes, R., Dalley, J., Gawarecki, L., Ghazi-Nezami, F., Shafer, G., Slater, J. & Yezbick, E. (2020). Fostering 
student engagement through a real-world, collaborative project across disciplines and institutions. Higher 

Education Pedagogies, 5(1), 30-51. DOI:10.1080/23752696.2020.1750306 

Meyer, D. F. & Mncayi, P. (2021). An analysis of underemployment among young graduates: The case of a higher 

education institution in South Africa. Economies, 9(4), 1-16. DOI:10.3390/economies9040196 

Mitev, A., Toth, R. & Vaszkun, B. (2024). Role transition of higher education teachers due to disruptive technological 

change: Identity reconstruction for a better teacher-student relationship. The International Journal of Management 

Education, 22, 1-15. DOI:10.1016/j.ijme.2024.100978. 

Mladenovici, V., Ilie, M. D., Maricutoiu, L. P. & Iancu, D. E. (2022). Approaches to teaching in higher education: The 

perspective of network analysis using the revised approaches to teaching inventory. Higher Education, 84, 255-

277. DOI:10.1007/s10734-021-00766-9 

Moalosi, R., Letsholo, P., Matake, B. & Ollyn, M. (2021). Enhancing graduate attributes through Work Integrated 
Learning: Students’ perspective. International Journal of Educational Development in Africa, 6(1), 1-23. 

DOI:10.25159/2312-3540/9696 

Nuangpirom, P., Jewpanya, P., Pitjamit, S., Jaichomphu, P. & Chaithanu, K. (2023). The educational process of the 

Work-integrated Learning (WIL) program: Case study of Engineering Faculty, Rajamangala University of 

Technology Lanna, Thailand. Journal of Technical Education and Training, 15(1), 246-256. Retrieved from 

http://penerbit.uthm.edu.my/ojs/index.php/jtet 

O’Neill, G., & Short, A. (2023). Relevant, practical and connected to the real world: what higher education students say 

engages them in the curriculum. Irish Educational Studies, 42, 1-18. DOI:10.1080/03323315.2023.2221663 

Pham, T. (2024). Work readiness of graduates in the digital age: A literature review. Ho Chi Minh City Open University 

Journal of Science - Social Sciences, 14(2), 113-120. DOI:10.46223/HCMCOUJS.soci.en.14.2.2820.2024. 

Pham, T., Soltani, B. & Nachatar Singh, J K. (2024) Employability capitals as essential resources for employment 

obtainment and career sustainability of international graduates, Journal of Further and Higher Education, 48(4), 
436-448, DOI: 10.1080/0309877X.2024.2344771 

Pietersen, D. (2022). Engaging Paulo Freire on deliberative democracy: Dialogical pedagogy, deliberation and inclusion 

in a transformative higher education online education space. Transformation in Higher Education. 7. 

10.4102/the.v7i0.211. 

Radil, A., Goegan, L. & Daniels, L. (2023). Teachers’ authentic strategies to support student motivation. Frontiers in 

Education, 8, 1-11. DOI:10.3389/feduc.2023.1040996. 

Raju, A. M. (2020). Online teaching and learning in HEI spaces: Success or failure? Alochana Chakra Journal, 9(7), 

1679-1682. Retrieved from 

https://www.researchgate.net/publication/369270142_ONLINE_TEACHING_AND_LEARNING_IN_HEI_SP

ACES_-SUCCESS_OR_FAILURE 

Ribosa, J., Noguera, I., Monguillot, M. & Duran, D. (2024). Teachers’ closeness of professional relationship and its role 
in learning perception after reciprocal peer observation. Teaching and Teacher Education, 140, 1-11. 

DOI:10.1016/j.tate.2024.104469 

Salama, R. & Hinton, T. (2023). Online higher education: current landscape and future trends. Journal of Further and 

Higher Education, 47(7), 913-924. DOI:10.1080/0309877X.2023.2200136 

Saeed, A., Asghar, M. Z., Malik, A. Masri S. (2021). Academics, teaching methods, and higher education. Turkish 

Journal of Physiotherapy and Rehabilitation, 32(3), 11765-11768. Retrieved from 

https://www.academia.edu/50796843/ACADEMICS_TEACHING_METHODS_AND_HIGHER_EDUCATIO

N 



Lin1 & Zaheril2., Uniglobal of Journal Social Sciences and Humanities Vol. 3 Issue. 2 (2024) p. 263-273 

 

273 

Schwab, S., Markus, S. & Hassani, S. (2022). Teachers’ feedback in the context of students’ social acceptance, students’ 

well-being in school and students’ emotions. Educational Studies, 50(5), 978-995. 

DOI:10.1080/03055698.2021.2023475 

Siacor, K. H., Ng, B. & Liu, W. C. (2024). Fostering student motivation and engagement through teacher autonomy 

support: A self-determination theory perspective. International Journal of Instruction, 17(2), 583-598. 
DOI:10.29333/iji.2024.17232a 

Subasman, I. & Rusmiati Aliyyah, R. (2023). The impact of technological transformation on career choices in the STEM 

sector. Jurnal Kajian Pendidikan dan Psikologi, 1(2), 129-142. DOI:10.61397/jkpp.v1i2.94. 

Sulaiman, A. H. & Abdullah, S. A. (2024). The use of active learning strategies to foster effective teaching in higher 

education institutions. Zanco Journal of Human Sciences, 28(2), 140-157. DOI:10.21271/zjhs.28.2.11. 

Sun, Y. (2021). The effect of teacher caring behavior and teacher praise on students' engagement in EFL classrooms. 

Frontiers in Psychology, 4(12), 1-9. DOI:10.3389/fpsyg.2021.746871 

Varas, D., Santana, M., Nussbaum, M., Claro, S. & Imbarack, P. (2023). Teachers’ strategies and challenges in teaching 

21st century skills: Little common understanding. Thinking Skills and Creativity, 48(4), 1-10. 

DOI:10.1016/j.tsc.2023.101289 

Vedder-Weiss, D., Roth, G. & Mishaeli, Y. (2024): Supporting teacher reflection and motivation through psychological 

needs satisfaction in collaborative reflection-based PD. Journal of Experimental Education, 1, 1-21. DOI: 
10.1080/00220973.2024.2309920 

Vela, D. R. M., Polo, S. M. Z. & Castillo, M. F. R. (2024). Transforming higher education: Effective strategies for 

contemporary curriculum design. Educational Administration: Theory and Practice, 30(3), 1985-1993. 

DOI:10.53555/kuey.v30i3.1577 

Wang, X. (2024). An investigation into how learning motivation affects college students’ major choices and academic 

performance in China. Journal of Education, Humanities and Social Sciences, 29, 214-222. 

DOI:10.54097/91kf9485 

Wei, C. Y., Ong, S. W., Diong, F. W., Ngeow, Y. M. & Chen, K. P. (2023). Remote learning satisfaction during COVID-

19 pandemic: A case study of a private higher education institution in Malaysia. Asia Pacific Journal of Educators 

and Education, 38(1), 163-187. DOI:10.21315/apjee2023.38.1.9 

Weiler, T. & Murad, M. W. (2022). Motivational factors influencing learners’ academic success in an Australian enabling 
education setting. Journal of Social Studies Education Research, 13(4), 97-119. Retrieved from 

/files.eric.ed.gov/fulltext/EJ1375011.pdf 

Williams, A. (2024). Delivering effective student feedback in higher education: An evaluation of the challenges and best 

practice. International Journal of Research in Education and Science, 10(2), 473-501. DOI:10.46328/ijres.3404 

Wood, A., Tait-Mccutcheon, S. & Knewstubb, B. (2020). Innovative teaching in higher education: Teachers’ perceptions 

of support and constraint. Innovations in Education and Teaching International, 58(2), 1-12. 

DOI:10.1080/14703297.2020.1715816. 

Yen, F. S. (2024). Investigating students’ 21st-century skills in a project work online learning environment: A case study. 

International Research Journal of Education and Sciences, 8(1), 37-46. Retrieved from 

https://www.masree.info/wp-content/uploads/2024/03/4ICOFEA-23-040-FOO-SOON-YEN.pdf 

Yidana, M. B., & Aboagye, G. K. (2024). Towards developing a 21st century curriculum through the perspective of the 

community of inquiry (COI) framework. Cogent Social Sciences, 10(1), 1-19. 
DOI:10.1080/23311886.2024.2364387 

Zaky, H. (2023). Feedback effectiveness in higher education: Utilizing students' feedback to foster teaching and learning. 

SSRN Electronic Journal. 7, 1-15. DOI:10.2139/ssrn.4505733. 

Zhao, Y. and Yang, L. (2022). Examining the relationship between perceived teacher support and students’ academic 

engagement in foreign language learning: Enjoyment and boredom as mediators. Frontiers in Psychology, 13, 1-

15. DOI:10.3389/fpsyg.2022.987554 

Zuin, A. & Mello, R. (2024). Educating with Paulo Freire: Teaching and learning on the digital culture. Educational 

Philosophy and Theory, 1(1). 1-20. DOI:10.1080/00131857.2024.2336025. 

 


